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FULL-TIME - INSIDE SALES, BOOM

TRUCK DRIVER, YARD WORKER

Experience preferred. Apply in person.
Crescent Lumber, 825-3317

Garbo Lobster, LLC is a Maine-based
company with worldwide markets op-
erating in a fast-paced work environ-
ment. We are seeking to fill the follow-
ing positions all based in Hancock, ME.
Email Annie anniet@garbolobster.com
to apply or for more info.

OFFICE MANAGER

Seeking honest, reliable, highly orga-
nized person to oversee admin. Must
be proficient in MS Word, Excel, Out-
look and have comprehensive knowl-
edge of QuickBooks for data entry, bill
pay, etc. 3-5 years experience neces-
sary. HR management skills helpful.

LOGISTICS COORDINATOR

Seeking trustworthy individual with 3 -
5 years experience in shipping logis-
tics. Coordinate shipping, bills of lad-
ing, reconciling quantities. Assist in
dispatching drivers and fleet mainte-
nance. Must work well under pressure.
Some minimal travel. Class A driver's
license helpful but not necessary.

ASSISTANT POUND MANAGER

Assist in managing lobster pound in-
ventory, conduct daily dives and re-
port findings. Must be a certified diver
with 2-3 years commercial experience
preferred and have comprehensive
computer skills.

HOUSEKEEPERS & FLR MAINTENANCE

FT/PT competitive wages, must pass
background check. Call RCCC, 990-4610

INTERNATIONAL COMPANY EXPAND-

ING IN THE BANGOR AREA Seeking 5
people in various positions, to start
immediately: *Entry Level, *Supervi-
sory, Management. No Exp necessary.

Must be neat, friendly, and have a
valid drivers lic. $600/wk + bonus To
start. Willing to train the right person-
(s). Call 207-989-5143 to qualify for an
interview. Veterans strongly recom-
mended to apply EOE. Beyond by
Aerus.

MULTIPLE POSITIONS

The Holiday Inn Bangor is looking for
enthusiastic hospitality workers to pro-
vide excellent guest service. Now ac-
cepting for FT or PT Front Desk Agent,
PT auditor, PT hosts, FT & PT house-
keepers. Neat in appearance. Must be
flexible. Apply in person at 404 Odlin
Rd, Bangor or

frontdesk@hibangor.com

OFFICE ASSIST/ COOK - SKY LODGE

JACKMAN, Sky Lodge is looking for
someone to join their office to do ad-
ministrative duties & also cook for our
groups that come & visit our Non Prof-
it Lodge. Accommodation is included,
you need to be a team player, cus-
tomer serviced orientated & adapt-
able. aussiemichelle@yahoo.com

OTR FLATBED DRIVERS - Class A lic.,
2 yrs. exp. Richwood Farms, 322-4626

OUTGOING PERSONALITY NEEDED

for busy office. Knowledge of Quick
Books, Payroll, Excel, Word, Publisher
& ability to balance a checkbook req.
Dean Young Forestry, 207-565-2709

PAVING LABORERS - F/T OR P/T

Driveway Maintenance Paving 848-8218

PAVING WORKERS OLD TOWN, Experi-
ence needed. Call 394-2234

PET GROOMER - EXPERIENCED

Full or part-time. Must be dependable,
self-motivated, and experienced with
finish clips on all common breed dogs.
Pay is negotiable. Call Sarah at

Bangor Pet Resort, 941-9825.

PIANIST/CHOIR DIRECTOR LINCOLN,
1st Congo.Sunday choir practice 9 am,
service @10:30. Some evening holiday
services. Must read music! 215-0679

PRODUCE PACKERS

GF Marketing, Inc. seeks 30 temp. F/T
produce packers for its Caribou, ME lo-
cation beginning Nov. 1, 2015 & ending
June 30, 2016. Packer is responsible for
all physical aspects of a produce pack-
aging operation to incl: sorting produce
by grade, filling, handling & stacking of
bags & boxes for shipment. Safe & effi-
cient use of co. tools & equip. is an in-
tegral part of responsibilities. Employer
provides without charge to workers any
& all supplies, tools & equip. req. to
perform the job. Applicant must be ca-
pable of handling 50 lbs. pkgd units
from waist height to shoulder height
repetitively. Applicant must be avail. for
a flexible work schedule & periods of
mandatory overtime. A min. of 3 mos
produce packing exp. req., incl. basic
skills in food safety protocols. Applicant
must also submit to a felony check in
order to comply with employer food
safety & security procedures. Normal
working hrs range from 7am to 7pm,
Mon.-Sat. Average work wk is 60 total
hrs. Pay: $10.72/hr up to 40 hrs wkly, af-
ter 40 hrs wkly overtime pay is $16.08/
hr., paid wkly. All deductions from pay-
check req'd by law will be made. Em-
ployer guarantees to offer work for hrs
equal to at least 3/4 of the workdays in
each 12 wk period of the total employ-
ment period. Transportation (incl. meals
&, to the extent nec., lodging) to the
place of employment will be provided,
or its cost to workers reimbursed, if the
worker completes half the employment
period. Return transp. will be provided
if worker completes employment peri-
od or is dismissed early by employer.
Employer will reimburse workers for all
in-bound & out-bound transp. & subsis-
tence cost accrued during in-bound &
out-bound travel within seven(7) work-
days in the form of a co. check. To ap-
ply: send cover letter & resume via US
Mail to: State Workforce Agency, ME
DOL - Bureau of Employment Services,
55 State House Station, Augusta, ME
04333-005, c/o Mr. Jorge Acero or via
fax: 207-287-5934. Refer to Job Order
#151264. In order to be considered, ap-
plicants need to follow-up with an in
person application visit at employer's
place of business: 3 Watson Memorial
Dr, Caribou, ME 04736. Tel. # 207-498-
8108, fax # 207-498-2098. Business
hours: 8 am-4 pm, M-F. Contact Mr. Bri-
an Guerrette upon arrival or call ahead
to make other interview arrangements
if travel to our facility is not feasible.

SPANISH TEACHER BANGOR: Part-
time. Revolutionary learning environ-
ment. $20-$25 per hour. 990-3500.

TANK ROOM/WAREHOUSE WORKER

Trenton Lobster Pound. Grading &
packing lobsters. F/T & P/T positions.
Apply at 1237 Bar Harbor Rd., Trenton

THE KENNEBEC VALLEY COMMUNITY

COLLEGE is accepting applications for
a PT Clerk of the Works position for the
Nutter Hall Renovations project at the
KVCC Alfond Campus in Hinckley, ME.
Prior construction observation & report-
ing exp., PC skills & personal vehicle
are req. Resumes shall be sent to Lewis
+ Malm Architecture, 124 Main St., P.O.
Box 1459, Bucksport, ME 04416 (469-
7440) by no later than 09SEP2015.

TRUCK DRIVERS WANTED OLD TOWN,
Class A&B Drivers, Experience Neces-
sary, Clean Driving Record. Call 394-
2234 EOE Direct Contact

Technician
Suburban Propane, a nationwide
provider of propane & related services
has the following opening in the
Hermon Center, ME area:

PROPANE SERVICE

TECHNICIAN II

Qual' incl a HS Diploma or equiv.
Class B CDL w/Hazmat and tanker
endorsements. Propane Technician
experience required. Propane licenses
4.1, 4.2, 4.3, 5.1, 7.0 preferred. Ability
to work a flexible schedule w/after-
hours call-outs, plus heavy lifting
required. Install, maintain, trouble-
shoot and repair gas fired equipment
and appliances.

Suburban offers a competitive salary
w/incentive potential and comprehen-
sive benefits including 401k and
tuition reimbursement. For add'l info
or to apply, visit our website at:
www.suburbanpropane.jobs. Select
Career Opportunities and search for
job opening ID 11569.

As part of our hiring process, DOT
physical required, background checks
and pre-employment drug tests are
performed. Suburban Propane is
proud to be an Equal Opportunity,
Affirmative Action Employer of
Females, Minorities, Individuals with
Disabilities and Protected Veterans in
accordance with all applicable laws.

WANT TO MAKE SOME

EXTRA MONEY?

MovingHelp.com is an online market-
place that offers labor services to cus-
tomers nationwide! As a Moving
Helper you will have the opportunity
to provide moving services to thou-
sands of customers in need. Moving
Help gives you real work with guaran-
teed payment!
Go to www.movinghelper.com and
click the "sign up now".

WEATHERIZATION TECHNICIAN

BUCKSPORT, Carpentry/ Insulation ex-
perience necessary. Positive attitude
required. Excellent interpersonal skills.
Full time, year round. Great pay and
benefits! 469.6100

Healthcare/Social Services117

DIRECT SUPPORT PROFESSIONALS

to serve individuals with intellectual &
physical disabilities in residential set-
tings. H.S. diploma or GED & valid ME
driver's lic. in good standing req. Eves,
overnights & weekends avail, incl. full-
time overnights. Starting pay $9/hr. W/
O certifications CRMA (Cert. Residen-
tial Medication Aide) & CDS (College
of Direct Support) trainings offered.
CRMA & DSP certifications req. for full
-time. FULL TIME POSITIONS AVAIL-

ABLE Post-offer pre-employment
physical & lifting assessment req.
To apply, please call Peg Buchanan @

Commonsense Housing, Inc, 989-1303

or apply at 15 Riverside Dr, Eddington.

CSH is an EOE

DSP Openings for P/T, F/T, and Per
Diem for our group homes & a Culi-
nary Specialist & an Art Specialist for
o u r d a y p r og r am . Con t a c t
info@citizensofmaine.com or

862-2360

ESM NOW HIRING

GROUP HOME STAFF

in the Bangor area with sign on bonus
and other bonuses

call 207 622 5946 or visit us at
www.esm-communityrehab.com

Professional/Management120

ACADEMIC MANAGER, BANGOR

(BRIDGE AT HUSSON UNIVERSITY)

Visit https://bridge.recruiterbox.com/jo
bs/fk0hr6y

COMPUTER PROGRAMMER

AmeriDyn, based in Holden, ME, has a
position open for a computer pro-
grammer. Duties include, but not limit-
ed to, Microsoft Dynamics GP account-
ing software customization, SQL Serv-
er programming and Reporting. The
successful candidate will have a Bach-
elor's degree in computer science (or
related field) or a minimum of 3 years
of experience. Salary is $40K - $65K
depending on education/experience.
Please send cover letter and resume to
info@AmeriDyn.com. No calls please.

IMMEDIATE OPENINGS

Director of Children's Case Manage-

ment: Full-time based out of Dover-
Foxcroft & Bangor. Should possess ex-
cellent communication, interpersonal
and documentation skills, and ability
to multitask. Master's Degree in Social
Work, Child Development, Human
Service, or related field req. Previous
experience working with children or
adolescents with disabilities or case
management experience preferred.
Career Planner: to help encourage &
integrate consumers into community
work settings by seeking & creating
lasting business relationships within
the local community to be able to
provide work support services to the
consumers we support.

Must have reliable transportation
& clean valid Maine driver's lic.

C.W.C. offers competitive pay/benefits,
excellent training & a supportive, team
oriented environment. Please visit
www.CharlotteWhiteCenter.com

for an application / E.O.E.

PRESIDENT, EASTERN MAINE

COMMUNITY COLLEGE

http://www.mccs.me.edu/about-mccs/
system-office/employment/

REAL ESTATE PARALEGAL BANGOR,
Bangor law firm seeks paralegal with
background in real estate titles and
closings, probate administration, and/
or commercial transactions. Earnings
commensurate with education and ex-
perience. Send resume and cover let-
ter to: Hiring Partner, Lanham Black-
well & Baber, P.A., 133 Broadway, Ban-
g o r, M a i n e 0 4 4 01
bbaber@lanhamblackwell.com

Sales/Telemarketing 125

INSURANCE CSR

Immediate opportunity for an experi-
enced personal lines CSR. Must have
professional experience and three of
more years personal lines experience.
Competitive pay and benefits package.
Apply in confidence to: Annie Collins

PO Box 1388, Bangor, Maine 04402

Apts. Efficiencies 210
BANGOR 1 BR/1 BA, Nice quiet close to
parks, bus route and laundrymat. H/hw/
elec inc. $600 207-358-0532

BANGOR RIVERVIEW MOTEL

$199.95/wk, on bus rte, 1 mi. from
EMMC/malls. 947-0125

BANGOR

effic. apts., all utils. paid, cable TV,
from $160 per week & up; 942-6376

Apts. Furnished 211

BANGOR - 1 & 2 BR Eagle Crest apts.,
exec. style, housewares & utils. incl. in-
ternet & cable. 1 mi. from EMMC &
Mall. Starting at $345 wkly or $995 mth-
ly. Sorry, no pets. Call 942-0428

STILLWATER near UMO, 1 & 2 BRs, in-
cls. all expenses, no smoke/pets. 207-
478-7235

Apts. Unfurnished 213
BANGOR - EAGLE CREST APTS

Lg, exec.-style 2BR, fully applianced kit,
pvt deck w/view of river. 1 mi. from
EMMC & mall. $925 incl. heat, H/W, ca-
ble & internet. 942-0428

BANGOR - Well maintained 2 BR town-
house. Heat, water & sewer incl. W/D
hookup in heated basement. $800/mo.
+ deposit. No pets. 947-7289

BANGOR 1 & 2 BR apts. $600-$775 &

efficiencies, $550. The Schoolhouse, no
smoking, incl heat & H/W, convenient
location, coin-op laundry, security sys-
tem, no pets. Applicant must qualify.

Equal Housing Opportunity.
For further info, call 947-1271

BANGOR 1 BR Studio on Court St. All
Utils. Incl. $550/mo.

www.leasebangor.com

BANGOR 1 BR/1 BA, 2nd fl. heat & h/w
no smoking -no pets - lease /security
dep. 944-8688 $650.00 207-944-8688
sinclairdelivery@hotmail.com

BANGOR 1 BR/1 BA, Charming, Lg
Rms, Dining Room 2nd Flr, No Smoke/
Dogs $750/mo. incl. utils. 991-0838

BANGOR 1 Bedroom, 38 Sixth, 2nd flr,
cozy, sunny, $595 h/hw, parking, sec
dep, $20 app fee, no pets 207-356-4858

BANGOR 1, 2 & 3 BR, $675 & up, exc.
cond., lease, sec. dep. Call for details,

942-8759!

BANGOR 1-2 BR,
remodeled, quiet, parking.

$625-$850, heat & H/W incl. 989-1166

BANGOR

2 BR 2nd flr., $750 Heat/HW, free W&D,
no smoking. 207-745-4982

BANGOR 2 BR, 1st floor, in quiet, well-
maintained older home; $825., incl.
heat/water/sewer/w-d hook-up. No
dogs, smoking, or large vehicles;
sec.dep. + refs. 207-942-2187

BANGOR 2 BR, 2nd flr., sunny, lg. kit.,
W/D hookup, garage, Heat/HW incl., no
smoke/pets. $900. Avail. 10/1. 942-1692

BANGOR 2 BR/1 BA, Heat/HW incl. 1st
flr townhouse lease & dep. req. No
pets/smoke $750/mo. 249-1093

BANGOR 3 BR w/bonus room, heat/HW
included, W/D hook up, no smoking.
$990 + deposit 207-299-6903

BANGOR AFFORDABLY PRICED

Immaculate & spacious executive
quality 1, 2, & 3 bedroom apartments.
BANGOR-Palm St. - lg. 1 BR, $700,
heat/HW incl. No smoking/pets.
BANGOR-Near Husson, 2+ BR, 2+ ba.,
washer/dryer, $1550, heat/HW incl
BREWER-Elm St., 2 BR lg. apt., $825,
heat/HW incl. No smoking/pets.

View us at HughesRS.com.

For details call 561-4700 in Bangor.

You're going to love where you live.

BANGOR CEDARWOODS

APARTMENTS

$200 sec. dep. Apply for our 2 BR apts
by July 31st, 2015 and sign a 12

month lease to qualify for this SPE-
CIAL. All rents include heat.
CALL KEYSTONE MGMT.

TODAY!! 866-2658

BANGOR Craigville Est. 1 & 2 BR, laun-
dry, all appliances, heat/HW, no smoke
$750-$850 mo. 942-7465, 813-701-8693

BANGOR/BREWER

1 & 2 bedroom apts.
$625 to $995. Call 947-8580 for appt.

BANGOR/BREWER

1, 2 & 3 BR remodeled apts. available.
www.bangor-maine.com 356-1847

Check out 'DES Property Management'
on Facebook!

BANGOR/HERMON New 2 BR/2BA con-
do, all wd flrs, nicer finishes $1150 incls
heat, lawn & snow plus has full Bsmt.
974-6606 www.RentBangor.com

BREWER 1 BR nice apt., ideal for 1 per-
son, private, parking, avail. Sept. 1.
$700 all utils. incl. 207-989-7066

BREWER 2BR - The Dirigo School Asso-
ciation has an opening for a 2BR unit
unfurnished for anyone that is 62/
Disabled. No smoking/no pet. $850 plus
one month security deposit. All utilities
included. Please call Brewer Housing
Authority for information. 207-989-7890

BREWER 3 BR, 2nd & 3rd floor, heat
included. Large yard. No smoking, no
pets. $850 + security. Call 207-356-5719

CHARLESTON

1 bedroom, all utilites & Directv includ-
ed. $700/mo. Call 207-478-7219

GLENBURN 2 BR, Part Furn. $950/mo.
incl heat, elec., space in gar. 1st, Sec, &
Refs. Req. No Pets/Smoke 717-6535

GLENBURN 3 BR, 1 car gar, $975 + dep.
Owner pays 1/2 utils. No smoke/drugs.
Sm. pet neg. w/dep. Avail 9/1. 852-6979

HAMPDEN 2 BR condo-style, quiet,
country living. $775 + dep. & elec. Incl.
water, sewer, plowing, trash removal,
parking, coin-op laundry. 207-416-2249

HAMPDEN 3 BR/1 BA, quite, country,
heat incl., no smoking, lease & deposit.
$1000 207-659-1321

HERMON 1 BR/1 BA, Executive Apart-
ment with office! Everything Inlcuded!
No Pets! Spacious and One Mile to
Bangor! $1,100 207-577-1017

KENDUSKEAG 2 BR/1 BA, 32 Center St.,
W/D hookup. No pets. $500 + security
deposit & references. Call 735-8483.

MADAWASKA Move in Spec. 1BR start-
ing-$195/mth. 2 BR-$295/mth. Sect 8 ap-
proved. Call 492-1900

MILFORD 1 BR/1 BA, heat & utils. incl.
5mi. to I95 & UMO, sec. depo. & lease
req. No Smoking $575 207-944-7978

OLD TOWN

1, 2, & 3 BR, heated, exc. cond.security
deposit $625-$900; 827-5483

OLD TOWN Quiet 2 BR, 2 BA, w/ w/d,
dw, fireplace, $850/mth heat & util. No
smoking/pets. Seq.& refs 207-902-3986

OLD TOWN Quiet 3 BR/w/ W/D, DW,
Frpl.,garden, deck. No pets/smoking.
$850/mth + heat & util. $850 902-3986

OLD TOWN Sm. 1BR, heat & HW, gas
for cooking. Dep., lease. No smoke/
dogs. $650. After 10am 207-827-5656

ORONO 2BR, Dryden Terrace immacu-
late, quiet prop w/ on-site mgmt, NO
PARTYING, Heat/HW incl, on-site W/D,
exc credit + refs req'd, $1,020-$1,195
EpsteinProperties 947-6737

ORONO Elderly 1 BR, rent starts at $645
+ utils. & heat. Community bldg. coin
op laundry, no smoking,. Applicant's
must qualify. Equal housing opportuni-
ty. Call Kathy at 947-6463 TTY 711

Commercial Property 215
BANGOR

DOWNTOWN OFFICE SUITES

Starting at $350. No smoking. 947-1271

BANGOR A+ office suites! Center city
loc! $150 & up, all utils. incl.

827-5483 or 942-8759

BANGOR Modern office space,
all sizes, good parking. BEST PRICES!
PRO Realty 947-6463, ask for David

BANGOR Office space downtown,
wood flrs, utilities included, starting at
$200 monthly, Paul Cook 852-0397

BANGOR/BREWER/HAMPDEN Several
very affordable, highly visible spaces,
some incl heat $350-$1200 974-6606
www.RentBangor.com

FORT KENT RETAIL SPACE

Main Street Store Front, 2500 Sq. Ft.

For more info: call Paul @ 316-6186c

HERMON

Morgan Hill Event Cntr, office space,
$250+/mo. leasebangor.com 990-2271

LINCOLN Office/retail space for lease.
Approx 4000 sq ft on Main St. Glass
front & conference rooms. ADA ap-
proved. Central air/hot water base-
board. 10 offices from 12x12 to 12x16.
Each office has own egress window.
Parking in front & rear. For more info
email: sammi7755@yahoo.com 207-290
-6648

House For Rent 217
BANGOR 2 BR/1 BA, Cathedral ceilings,
dishwasher, W/D hookup. Water & sew-
er included. $900+ dep. 207-852-3593

BANGOR 4 BR/2.5 BA, Colonial, close to
EMMC & downtown, very lg w/wd flrs,
gar., 8-12 mo. lease ok $1300 + utils 974
-6606 www.RentBangor.com

BANGOR GARDENS 2 BR/1 BA, heat,
water & sewer incl., W/D hookup, $950/
mo. + sec. dep. No smoking. 944-6859

BANGOR Lux townhouse at Orchard
Hills 2BR/1.5BA, $1250/mo. no pets. sec
dep & lease, avail 9/15 951-4244

BANGOR New Exec. 2 BR/2BA condo,
granite, real wd flrs, all 1st flr + gar. Ful-
ly furn. & short term neg. $2300 all utils
incl 974-6606 www.RentBangor.com

BANGOR/HERMON - 2 BR 3 BA under
construction condos w/basement. All
Wood flrs, upgrade appliances & never
lived in! Avail Sept thru Dec 974-6606
www.RentBangor.com 207-974-6606

BRADLEY 3 BR/1.5 BA, 15 min. to
UMO & 20 min. to Bgr. spacious lg
kit.& liv room heat incld. $1195/mo.
1st, last, & sec. (not sec. 8) no pets,
non smoker pref. Available Aug
10th.FMI 431-3410 or 356-4899

BREWER 4 BR/2 BA, split level w/wd
flrs, granite, nice backyard, 2 car gar. &
heat pump $1500 + utils 974-6606
www.RentBangor.com

DEDHAM 2 BR/1 BA, Lake, furn, w/d,
Sept-June $850+h/u, see online ad for
link to website w/details 207-843-6672

VEAZIE 3 BR/2 BA, farm-style house,
$1250 + utils. Lg. lot, sewer incl. 207-
942-1440 / 772-214-4197

Mobile Home Rentals 220
BRADLEY 2 BR 1.5BA Nicely remodeled
mobile home W/addition. Detached
gar. Heat/HW, plows, mowing incl. No
smoke/pets. $800 mth+sec. 852-8451

CARMEL 2 BR quiet dead-end rd. Lrg
shed, new flooring, W/D no smoke/pets
$650 plus util. lease/dep req.. 745-7635

HERMON 3 BR/2 BA, W/D hookup, pri-
vate lot, $800/mo. + utilities & security
deposit. No dogs. 207-735-8483

HUDSON 2 & 3 BR, quiet neighbor-
hood. Option to buy. $575/mo. + de-
posit & utilities. Call 327-1512

LEVANT 3 BR/1.5 BA, very nice mobile
home, Pvt. wooded lot w/yard, $650 +
utilities. 207-884-7121

OLD TOWN 2 BR/1 BA, Newly renovat-
ed, in quiet park. $650 + utilities. 207-
394-2234

ORONO/OLD TOWN 1 & 2 BR, large,
small, clean, quiet, heated, no pets, de-
posit, $550 & up; 942-3444

Mobile Home Lot Rentals 221

CEDARFALLS

MOBILE HOME PARK

*Several lots available.
Quiet, convenient location
near downtown Bangor.
Rental $260 per month.
NO ENTRANCE FEE

Call Keystone Management
207-866-2658

OLD TOWN Mobile Home Lot available
in quiet park. $200/month with $400
entrance fee. Call 394-2234

Rooms 230
BANGOR Exceptional room, cable, own
fridge, hdwd floors, VERY quiet. $500 +
dep. & refs. No pets or guests. 356-5117

BANGOR Monthly rates starting at
$695, $100 sec. dep. In room wi-fi, mi-
cro/frig, utils. incl. 945-2934,

www.rangerinn.com

BANGOR Single occupancy, no drugs
or drinking. $450/month plus deposit.
Leave message, 990-2378

BREWER In town, park view, $240+/wk.
WiFi, micro/fridge, non-smoking room
$220+/wk Brewer Motor Inn, 989-4476

BREWER Private room/entrance, utili-
ties, kit/laundry privileges, cable, no de-
posit. Call 207-989-1850

GLENBURN Furnished, queen bed,
clean, quiet, $80/wk, deposit, refer-
ences. Call 207-214-7351

Seasonal Rentals 255
ORIENT - Cottage/lodge, East Grand
Lake Orient, Swim-Fish-Hunt Reason-
able prices. 448-2929

SUNSET CAMPS -

Labor Day Special. Sept. 4-7.
$275-$325. 207-362-2611

Roommates 265

CLIFTON 2 roommates wanted in 3 br,
2 bath home. $85/week + $85 deposit.
References required. 745-4157

Acreage/Lots 302

BANGOR

8+/- acres with 650' frontage
on Kittredge Road.

Nicely wooded and private.
Chance for building lots.

$109,800
Kelly E. Rioux

207.879.9229 / 207.838.3405

EDDINGTON

2 acre house lot, cleared with driveway,
new well, new 3 Bedroom septic and
power pole $45,000 207-570-6200

HAMPDEN/WINTERPORT ESTATE

SALE. No reasonable offer refused.
Laskey Ln, Hampden, .55 acs. $23,000*
136 Monroe Rd, Hampden, 2.67 acs.
$43,000*. Rte. 69, Hampden, 2.13 acs.
$32,000*. 69 Twinning Rd., Winterport,
16.27 acs. $5,000*. Call 404-3131 for
particulars. * Town Assessed

MAINE LAND WANTED We are seek-
ing100+ acre parcels, brokers protect-
e d . 6 0 3-8 8 8-6 100 o r e m a i l
epearson@equivise.com.

PEMBROKE 11 lots avail. Oceanfront
with red stone beach lot sizes 1.6ac. to
5ac. soil tested, surveyed, Owner Fi-
n a n c i n g a v a i l . e m a i l
austingogden@gmail.com or Call 207-
294-1060 prices starting at $69,900

Camps For Sale 304
AURORA Waterfront Union River camp
2BR, propane heat, poss. year round.
Owner Financing $77,900. 294-1060

DEXTER Wonderful 3-4 BR on shore of
Lake Wassookeag. Huge deck, open flr
plan, cathedral ceilings, 2-car gar.
$225,000 Vacationland Realty, Jean
Jenkins 745-4522 www.jeanjenkins.com

GARLAND POND Waterfront complete-
ly furn., adorable cottage. Go Green!
Solar Powered & Wired for 12 Volt!
$65,000 Vacationland Realty, Jean Jenk-
ins, 745-4522. www.jeanjenkins.com

LEE Lake front camp w/130' of water
frontage on Silver Lake. 2BR/1BA, pvt
septic & well. $94,900 Nadeau/Bragdon
Team, ERA Dawson, 947-3363/723-1441

General General

BUSINESS OPPORTUNITIES

BREWER - in town

LINCOLN - in town

MILLINOCKET - in town

ROCKLAND - in town

VEAZIE - in town

BREWER/GLEBURN

BREWER/ORRINGTON

HAMPDEN/WINTERPORT

HOULTON/LINNEUS

MACHIAS/CUTLER

PRESQUE ISLE/FORT FAIRFIELD

PRESQUE ISLE/WESTFIELD

UNION/WARREN

8288

8288

General General


